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Cosmically fast-paced and wildly imaginative, this debut novel is a perfect potion of magic and suspense
Once a city of enormous wealth and culture, Prague was home to emperors, alchemists, astronomers, and, as
it's whispered, hell portals. When music student Sarah Weston lands a summer job at Prague Castle
cataloging Beethoven's manuscripts, she has no idea how dangerous her life is about to become. "Prague is a
threshold, "Sarah is warned, "and it is steeped in blood.
" Soon after Sarah arrives, strange things begin to happen. She learns that her mentor, who was working at
the castle, may not have committed suicide after all. Could his cryptic notes be warnings? As Sarah parses
his clues about Beethoven's "Immortal Beloved," she manages to get arrested, to have tantric sex in a public
fountain, and to discover a time-warping drug. She also catches the attention of a four-hundred-year-old
dwarf, the handsome Prince Max, and a powerful U.S. senator with secrets she will do anything to hide.
"City of Dark Magic "could be called a rom-com paranormal suspense novel--or it could simply be called
one of the most entertaining novels of the year.
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From reader reviews:

Arthur Haase:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. These are
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who
don't like reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or even exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this City Of Dark Magic (Thorndike Press Large Print Basic Series).

Mary Partee:

The feeling that you get from City Of Dark Magic (Thorndike Press Large Print Basic Series) is the more
deep you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but City Of Dark Magic (Thorndike Press Large Print Basic
Series) giving you joy feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This
specific book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can
go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this kind of
City Of Dark Magic (Thorndike Press Large Print Basic Series) instantly.

Mary Richards:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, going to beach,
or picnic inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your
cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you
want to try look for book, may be the reserve untitled City Of Dark Magic (Thorndike Press Large Print
Basic Series) can be fine book to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Edward Florez:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is
known as of book City Of Dark Magic (Thorndike Press Large Print Basic Series). Contain your knowledge
by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read.
It is most important that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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