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Paleomagnetism is the study of the fossil magnetism in rocks. It has been paramount in determining that the
continents have drifted over the surface of the Earth throughout geological time. The fossil magnetism
preserved in the ocean floor has demonstrated how continental drift takes place through the process of sea-
floor spreading. The methods and techniques used in paleomagnetic studies of continental rocks and of the
ocean floor are described and then applied to determining horizontal movements of the Earth's crust over
geological time. An up-to-date review of global paleomagnetic data enables 1000 million years of Earth
history to be summarized in terms of the drift of the major crustal blocks over the surface of the Earth.

The first edition of McElhinny's book was heralded as a "classic and definitive text." It thoroughly discussed
the theory of geomagnetism, the geologic reversals of the Earth's magnetic field, and the shifting of magnetic
poles. In the 25 years since the highly successful first edition of Palaeomagnetism and Plate Tectonics
(Cambridge, 1973) the many advances in the concepts, methodology, and insights into paleomagnetism
warrant this new treatment. This completely updated and revised edition of Paleomagnetism: Continents and
Oceans will be a welcome resource for a broad audience of earth scientists as well as laypeople curious
about magnetism, paleogeography, geology, and plate tectonics.

Because the book is intended for a wide audience of geologists, geophysicists, and oceanographers, it
balances the mathematical and descriptive aspects of each topic.

Details the theory and methodology of rock magnetism, with particular emphasis on intrepreting crustal●

movements from continental and oceanic measurements
Outlines Earth history for the past 1000 million years, from the Rodinia super-continent through its●

breakup and the formation of Gondwana to the formation and breakup of Pangea and the amalgamation of
Eurasia
Provides a comprehensive treatment of oceanic paleomagnetism●

Provides a set of color pateogeographic maps covering the past 250 million years●

Written by two internationally recognized experts in the field●
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From reader reviews:

Daniel Grinder:

This book untitled Paleomagnetism, Volume 73, Second Edition: Continents and Oceans (International
Geophysics) to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that is because when you read this e-book
you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy that book in the book store or you can order it by
way of online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because
you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to you to past this publication from your list.

Dorinda Kling:

Paleomagnetism, Volume 73, Second Edition: Continents and Oceans (International Geophysics) can be one
of your basic books that are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this publication has
good vocabulary that may increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining
however delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to place every word into delight
arrangement in writing Paleomagnetism, Volume 73, Second Edition: Continents and Oceans (International
Geophysics) but doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource
info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information may drawn you into new stage of crucial
pondering.

David Sayre:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind expertise
or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy your
short period of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more time to be learn.
Paleomagnetism, Volume 73, Second Edition: Continents and Oceans (International Geophysics) can be
your answer mainly because it can be read by you who have those short free time problems.

Mark Morrow:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we wish. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book Paleomagnetism, Volume 73, Second Edition: Continents and Oceans
(International Geophysics) was filled with regards to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge
about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when they reading the book. If
you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era
like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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