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Case Preparation equips trainee barristers with the skills required to prepare a winning case. Providing
invaluable advice on conducting effective legal research and reliable techniques for preparing convincing
arguments to legal problems, the practical approach of the manual is enhanced through worked examples and
realistic case papers throughout.

Dedicated chapters on legal research guide the reader through the plethora of print and electronic sources
available and provide invaluable practical guidance on how to conduct successful legal research, while
chapters focusing specifically on reading and interpreting cases, and presenting and recording research trails,
highlight the process of research undertaken. Worked examples are also contained throughout to highlight
legal research in action.

The manual also introduces the trainee barrister to a systematic C.A.P. (Context, Analyze, Present) approach
to analyzing a client's case designed to provide an efficient and reliable method for preparing sound answers
and convincing arguments to legal problems. Covering both civil and criminal cases, realistic sets of papers
are used to demonstrate the C.A.P approach in practice and additional sets of papers are provided to
encourage students to practise developing their case preparation skills.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Tuck:

Throughout other case, little people like to read book Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition (Bar
Manuals). You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. So long as we know about how is
important the book Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition (Bar Manuals). You can add expertise and of
course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can learn
everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple factor
until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book or maybe searching by
internet system. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Robert Mundo:

The experience that you get from Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition (Bar Manuals) may be the more
deep you rooting the information that hide into the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition (Bar Manuals)
giving you excitement feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in particular way that can be
understood by anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. That book also
makes your vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or
e-book style are available. We advise you for having this kind of Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition
(Bar Manuals) instantly.

James Pierce:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Case Preparation 2009-2010:
2009 Edition (Bar Manuals) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this book.
Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then
how they react to the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky man but
for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start reading as your
good habit, you may pick Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition (Bar Manuals) become your own
starter.

Lou Whisenhunt:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
easier to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to your account is Case Preparation 2009-2010: 2009 Edition (Bar Manuals) this reserve
consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now. That book was represented how do the



world has grown up. The words styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer
made some investigation when he makes this book. That is why this book appropriate all of you.
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