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A philosopher, architect, astronomer, and polymath, Thomas Jefferson lived at a time when geography was
considered the "mother of all sciences." Although he published only a single printed map, Jefferson was also
regarded as a geographer, owing to his interest in and use of geographic and cartographic materials during
his many careers?attorney, farmer, sometime surveyor, and regional and national politician?and in his
twilight years at Monticello. For roughly twenty-five years he was involved in almost all elements of the
urban planning of Washington, D.C., and his surveying skills were reflected in his architectural drawings,
including those of the iconic grounds of the University of Virginia. He understood maps not only as valuable
for planning but as essential for future land claims and development, exploration and navigation, and
continental commercial enterprise.

In The True Geography of Our Country: Jefferson’s Cartographic Vision, Joel Kovarsky charts the
importance of geography and maps as foundational for Jefferson’s lifelong pursuits. Although the world had
already seen the Age of Exploration and the great sea voyages of Captain James Cook, Jefferson lived in a
time when geography was of primary importance, prefiguring the rapid specializations of the mid- to late-
nineteenth-century world. In this illustrated exploration of Jefferson’s passion for geography?including his
role in planning the route followed and regions explored by Lewis and Clark’s Corps of Discovery, as well
as other expeditions into the vast expanse of the Louisiana Purchase?Kovarsky reveals how geographical
knowledge was essential to the manifold interests of the Sage of Monticello.
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From reader reviews:

Mae Saari:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of many ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to definitely imagine
the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this The True Geography of Our Country: Jefferson's Cartographic Vision, you are able to tells your
family, friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them
reading a publication.

Steven Holt:

The book with title The True Geography of Our Country: Jefferson's Cartographic Vision posesses a lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world at this point. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you in
new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere
you want.

Judy Young:

The actual book The True Geography of Our Country: Jefferson's Cartographic Vision has a lot associated
with on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very
famous author. The author makes some research prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you can
obtain the point easily after looking over this book.

Richard King:

The book untitled The True Geography of Our Country: Jefferson's Cartographic Vision contain a lot of
information on the item. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
published by famous author. The author brings you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book
because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book within anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site along with
order it. Have a nice go through.
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