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Korea, "The Forgotten War" occurred only five years after the end of World War II.The American citizens,
weary of more carnage, but President Harry S. Truman was determined to stop the spread of communism in
the Far East. He petitioned the United Nations to get other nations to send troops to support the United
States.It was my misfortune to be drafted into the United States Army during this miserable "Police Action"
as it was called at that time. I spent thirteen months in Korea from April 1952 to May 1953.You will be taken
across the Pacific on the troopship, General Black along with many other seasick G.I.s and Canadian troops
into Inchon harbor to the forboding hills of Korea to replace combat worn soldiers who have spent their time
in purgatory.You will get to meet my friends and comrades from all parts of the U.S. who make up the 955
Field Artillery Battalion You will listen to their gripes and the occasional raw humor that get them through
the misery of day-to-day routine. Listen to the ungodly din of the big howitzers and the Long Toms blasting
away day and night. It''s enough to drive you nuts.For eight months I worked as one of a three man forward
observation team, in the bunkers and trenches with Republic of Korea infantry who do not speak English.
Hide in a bunker as "Joe Chink" fires rockets at you. Feel the claustrophobia of being trapped in a freezing
bunker at night as the enemy surrounds you. C''mon. Join the adventure! It''s all true. With photos.
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From reader reviews:

Luther Roberts:

This Land of the Morning Calm are reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The
reason why of this Land of the Morning Calm can be one of the great books you must have will be giving
you more than just simple examining food but feed you actually with information that possibly will shock
your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your
conditions at e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Land of the Morning Calm forcing you to have an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we all know it
useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Steven Connell:

Typically the book Land of the Morning Calm will bring one to the new experience of reading a book. The
author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to read, this book very
appropriate to you. The book Land of the Morning Calm is much recommended to you to see. You can also
get the e-book from official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Sandra Wright:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
wide range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we
will say absolutely indeed. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever
try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book you have
read is actually Land of the Morning Calm.

Ricardo Huddle:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book mainly book entitled Land of
the Morning Calm your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that
maybe unknown for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a book
then become one contact form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get prior to. The Land
of the Morning Calm giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving
you useful info for your better life in this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern this is your
body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a casino game. Do
you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?
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