
Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in
Argentina (Global Issues Series)

Eduardo P. Archetti

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1859732666
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1859732666
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1859732666


Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina
(Global Issues Series)

Eduardo P. Archetti

Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) Eduardo P. Archetti

The complex relationship between nationalism and masculinity has been explored both historically and
sociologically with one consistent conclusion: male concepts of courage and virility are at the core of
nationalism. In this ground-breaking book, the author questions this assumption and advances the debate
through an empirical analysis of masculinity in the revealing contexts of same-sex (football and polo) and
cross-sex (tango) relations. Because of its rich history, Argentina provides the ideal setting in which to study
the intersection of masculine and national constructs: hybridization, creolization and a culture of
performance have all informed both gender and national identities. Further, the author argues that, counter to
claims made by globalization theorists, the importance of performance to Argentinian men and women has a
long history and has powerfully shaped the national psyche.

But this book takes the analysis far beyond national boundaries to address general arguments in anthropology
which are not culture-specific, and the discussion poses important comparative questions and addresses
central theoretical issues, from the interplay of morality and ritual, to a comparison between the popular and
the aristocratic, to the importance of 'othering' in national constructions - particularly those relating to sport.

This book represents a major contribution, not only to anthropology, but to the study of gender, nationalism
and culture in its broadest sense.
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From reader reviews:

Diana Sturgill:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Masculinities:
Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series)? Maybe it is being best activity for you.
You already know beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Ladonna Warren:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while
is reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Masculinities: Football,
Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) book as beginning and daily reading reserve. Why,
because this book is greater than just a book.

Georgia Cunningham:

This book untitled Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) to be one
of several books that will best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of
benefit in it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book shop or you can order it via online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read
this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Catherine Cote:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know everything
we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year has been exactly
added. This reserve Masculinities: Football, Polo and the Tango in Argentina (Global Issues Series) was
filled with regards to science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence.
Some people has several feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can truly feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you simply
wanted.
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